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The Scottish Wildlife Trust welcomes the Oxfam Humankind Index which reflects a true 
measure of Scotland's prosperity rather than the traditional indicator Gross Domestic 
Product (GDP). 
 
Oxfam’s work has highlighted what really matters to the people of Scotland. Affordable 
housing, having good physical and mental health, and living in an area with a clean and 
healthy environment where the outdoors can be enjoyed, all score very highly and are above 
monetary considerations.  
 
That the quality of outdoor space matters and contributes to health and wellbeing, is 
supported by a growing body of evidence which shows that access to good quality urban 
greenspace is essential for physical activity,1,2 positive mental well-being3 and healthy 
childhood development.4 Contact with nature has also been shown to reduce the severity of 
childhood Attention Deficit Hyperactivity Disorder.5 In addition, it has been found that income 
related health inequalities are reduced by having easy access to high quality greenspace.6  
 
GDP as a measure of prosperity does not reflect the social and human price paid for the side 
effects of economic activity, such as air pollution and natural resource depletion. For 
instance, between 1981 and 2005 the global economy more than doubled, but 60% of the 
world’s ecosystems were either degraded or over-used.7 GDP is also driven by perversities; 
treatment by the health service of those suffering from respiratory diseases caused by poor 
air quality is included as a positive contributor to GDP.8  
 
Scotland needs to move towards a vision of growth in which it is recognised that a ‘healthy’ 
environment is an absolute requirement for the ‘good health’ of societal and economic 
systems. Such a system of economic growth is founded on a green economy which the 
United Nations Environment Programme (UNEP) describes as resulting in improved human 
well-being and social equity. A green economy also significantly reduces environmental risks 
and ecological scarcities.9   The people of Scotland instinctively know this is the right way 
forward, and the Scottish Wildlife Trust agrees with Oxfam’s recommendation that the way 
forward is for the economy to serve the people not the other way around. 
 
Scotland’s natural capital (e.g. biodiversity and ecosystem services) provide essential 
services upon which Scotland’s true prosperity depends such as providing clean water, high 
quality environments, recreational facilities and improved air quality. It has been estimated 
that the total value of these services to Scotland is worth in excess of £21 billion per year.10 
 
Scotland has led the way in setting ambitious greenhouse gas emission reduction targets 
and moving towards a low carbon economy. However it should also recognise that growth 
should be driven by investments that increase resource efficiency11 and prevent the loss of 
natural capital and the ecosystem services they provide.  
 



  
  

To conclude, improving the quality of life for the people of Scotland will require policy and 
decision makers to rethink and redefine traditional measures of wealth, prosperity and well-
being. The Oxfam Humankind Index shows how this might be done. The biggest risk to the 
people of Scotland may arise from maintaining the status quo. 

 
 

 
About the Scottish Wildlife Trust: 
 
The Scottish Wildlife Trust’s central aim is to advance the conservation of Scotland’s 
biodiversity for the benefit of present and future generations. With over 35,000 members, 
several hundred of whom are actively involved in conservation activities locally, we are 
proud to say we are now the largest voluntary body working for all the wildlife of Scotland. 
The Trust owns or manages 122 wildlife reserves and campaigns at local and national levels 
to ensure wildlife is protected and enhanced for future generations to enjoy.   
 
 
 
For further information please contact: 
Dr. Maggie Keegan, National Planning Co-ordinator, mkeegan@swt.org.uk, 0131 312 1462 / 
07739 428213 
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